
30 Cozens Street, Warwick, CV35 9SU
Guide Price £375,000



This beautifully presented three bedroom detached property is located in this quiet position just south of Wellesbourne town centre on the fringe of this popular development
known as Dovehouse Estate. Offering comfortable and well thought out living together with lovely rural outlook closely. Local amenities are close by as too is Wellesbourne
itself together with other major towns.

LOCATION
Cozens Street is located on this popular
development 'Dovehouse Estate' just
south of Wellesbourne of which offers
an abundance of amenities such as
public houses, supermarkets, local
schools including nursery and primary
amongst others. It is well placed to take
advantage of being close to the major
road ne tworks  wi th  la rge loca l
businesses not far away. There are
some lovely rural views on offer as
Cozens Street is located on the edges
of this development.

GROUND FLOOR
Upon entry the welcoming entrance
h a l l w a y  g i v e s  w a y  t o  a  w e l l
proportioned living room to the front
with solid timber flooring and modern
decoration. In turn there is a modern
and well equipped dining kitchen to the
rear. The kitchen comes equipped with
an array of appliances and is finished
with a contemporary gloss finish and
complementary work surfaces. There is
a large breakfast bar separating the
kitchen and dining space and doors
lead out into the private gardens. There
is also a separate utility with plumbing
for the white goods and also a WC on
this level.

FIRST FLOOR
The first floor has a spacious and bright
landing with access to the loft and gives
access to all rooms on this floor. There
are three bedrooms in total, all finished
and presented beautifully with the
principal bedroom having a modern
ensuite shower room. There is also a
well equipped family bathroom serving
the other two bedrooms.

OUTSIDE
The property benefits with having a
tandem driveway leading to the garage
of which serves part of the rear gardens
walling. To the rear, accessed from the
dining kitchen via double doors, you
find a charming private garden with two
paved patio areas and pathways
leading onto the lawns and garage side
access. There are mature stocked
borders and s ide access to the
driveway too.
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